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Good afternoon Chairman Treyger and members of the Education Committee. My name is
Lindsey Oates, and I am the chief financial officer (CFO) at the NYC Department of Education.
Seated with me is Dr. Laura Feijoo, senior superintendent for labor and policy. I want to thank
you for the opportunity to discuss this important topic. How we allocate resources to schools is
one of the most important concerns for the Chancellor and for me as CFO. Personally, as a
public school parent it is also one that is very close to my heart. I look forward to working
together with you all to continue to increase the resources allocated to schools to provide all New
York City students with an equitable and excellent education.

Guaranteeing all New York City students have access to an equitable and excellent education has
been a key focus of this Administration. Under this Administration, we’ve cumulatively made
$4 billion in new education investments through our Equity and Excellence for All agenda to
support our schools and improve student outcomes. This includes over $800 million over this
time period to raise the Fair Student Funding (FSF) “floor” – which is the lowest percentage at
which a school can be funded at. This year alone, these floor raises have increased school
budgets by over $350 million. The vast majority of the FSF funding increases have been
dedicated to those schools previously receiving funding at or near the floor.

At the beginning of this Administration, the “FSF floor” was 81 percent, with the average school
at 87 percent. It has been a top priority of ours and yours to raise the floor every year, and last
year, with the partnership of the Council, we were proud to jointly announce a floor of 90
percent, with schools across the city receiving an average of 93 percent of their FSF.
Additionally, as part of our targeted investments, our most historically underserved schools,
including Renewal Schools, are fully funded at 100 percent. We are grateful to Speaker Johnson
and Chairs Treyger and Dromm and the Council for their support and look forward to our
continued partnership.

Beyond our increases to FSF, we have also made critical investments to ensure that all students
have access to rigorous curriculum and instruction at every grade level. Through our Equity and
Excellence for All agenda, our students are starting school earlier with access to free, full-day,
high-quality, education for three-year-olds and four-year-olds, through 3-K for all and Pre-K for
All. We are strengthening students’ foundational skills with Universal Literacy and Algebra for
All. And we are providing more support to our students along the way, with College Access for
All, Single Shepherd, and Community Schools.

Our investments are yielding real progress. Our graduation rate is at 74.3 percent, the highest it
has ever been, while our dropout rate, 7.8 percent, is the lowest it has ever been. College
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enrollment and readiness are also at record highs. For the third year in a row, New York City’s
students outperformed the rest of the State on English Language Arts and we are continuing to
close the gap with the State on the State Math exam.

I would now like to speak in more detail about the Fair Student Funding or “FSF” formula. FSF
is one of the most important tools that we have to ensure that schools are funded equitably –
providing additional resources to schools with higher need students.

Prior to FSF and the centralized decision-making under Mayoral Control, superintendents set the
budgets for their schools. As a result, schools were funded differently across and sometimes
even within districts. In fiscal year 2008, to meet the goal of education equity, the DOE
implemented the FSF formula.

FSF is driven by equity, with student needs at the core of the formula, and the data shows that
it’s been successful in advancing it. Per capita budgets are higher at schools with high
concentrations of students in poverty, students with disabilities, English Language Learners, and
schools with lower Math and ELA performance and graduation rates.

FSF distributes funds employing a weighted student funding formula. Simply put, this means
that a school’s student population – and their needs – determine the majority of that school’s
budget. The weights in the formula represent the relative funding schools need to meet the
instructional mandates for each need. FSF funding starts with funding each pupil based on their
grade level. Then needs, or weights, are added into the formula based on the pupil’s English
Language Learner status, special education needs, academic intervention services, and Career
and Technical Education programming, among others. FSF also includes $225,000 to fund basic
administrative expenses such as the principal’s and secretary’s salaries. In recent years, we have
also included collective bargaining costs associated with the staff currently employed by a
school.

The formula strategically targets more funding toward schools with the greatest level of need.
Data regarding each school’s student needs that feed into the FSF formula are updated twice a
year in order to be responsive to changing student enrollment and needs.

At the school level, principals work throughout the year with their School Leadership Teams and
superintendents to determine the right way to meet these needs for their students. Schools
dedicate a majority of this funding towards staff – 96 percent of FSF dollars are spent on
pedagogues, including classroom teachers, guidance counselors, social workers, and
paraprofessionals.

In addition to raising the floor, every year the DOE evaluates the FSF weights to ensure that they
represent the true cost of meeting each student’s instructional needs. The DOE consults with
superintendents, Community Education Councils (CECs), and ultimately the Panel for
Educational Policy (PEP) prior to finalizing weights for the upcoming school year. For example,
in fiscal year 2017, the DOE updated its weights for English Language Learners by creating
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bilingual weights, weights for students who had achieved English proficiency, and weights for
students with interrupted formal education. This directed an additional $40 million annually in
resources to students who are learning English across the system.

The funding for FSF comes from City tax levy and State dollars. Federal funds, as well as State
and City funds that have specific statutory requirements or policy mandates designed to meet
particular academic and community needs, are not a part of FSF. However, the vast majority of
school budgets – approximately two thirds – are allocated via FSF.

In 2007, the promise of new funding owed to the City as a result of the Campaign for Fiscal
Equity decision brought the hope of every school receiving 100 percent of its FSF. The thought
was, once new funds were received, all schools would be funded equitably. However, as we all
know, the State funds never materialized. The remaining obligation from the State to the City is
$1.2 billion in this fiscal year alone. As a result, our system has schools below 100 percent of
their FSF. For this reason, you will often hear that a school is funded at a certain percentage of
its FSF, meaning that even as we are allocating more resources to our schools than ever before,
we are still painfully aware of the gap that remains. That is why, in past years, when State
funding was sufficient to cover existing mandates and more, we used the additional funding to
increase the FSF floor

The Chancellor has emphasized that our schools must be equitably funded. The DOE always
strives to direct any available funds towards the schools who need it most. However, the City
simply cannot afford to close the gap alone. It would cost the City approximately $750 million
to raise all schools to 100 percent of their FSF level. In order to achieve this, we need the state
to fulfill the promise of the Campaign for Fiscal Equity. We are grateful to the Council for your
advocacy in Albany and we look forward to working with you in the coming legislative season to
push for that funding.

The DOE is deeply committed to financial transparency. New Yorkers deserve to know that
their tax dollars are well-spent, and parents deserve to know that schools have adequate
resources to educate their children.

The DOE posts extensive school and department budget information on our website. We publish
Financial Status Reports, or FSRs, six times a year which detail department-wide budget changes
including the current-year budget and spending. The most recent FSR was published in
September, and our website also host over 10 years of FSR archives. We publish every school
allocation online with a memorandum explaining its use, as well as an exhaustive guide to FSF.
Additionally, for every school, we publish a full accounting of the math behind FSF allocations,
each school’s allocation and budget updated daily, and a retrospective school-based expenditure
report which calculates per pupil spending for every school in the system. All of this
information is available on the DOE’s website for anyone to download and view.
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This year, we’ve also published school-level budget information in a new report. This report
includes – in one spreadsheet – not only FSF information for each school, but also enrollment
and staff information, how schools plan to spend their budget, and detailed information on pre-k
and Community Schools.

In the coming years we plan to continue and expand this important work so that parents,
advocates, and elected officials have access to clear, digestible information about their school’s
budget. We are committed to this work and look forward to having an ongoing dialogue with
you and with the public on the topic.

I would now like to turn to the legislation being considered today.

Intro. 1014-A requires the creation of a report that would include information on all school-level
budget allocation and FSF for each school. We support the spirit of this legislation and would
like to work with the Council to align reporting requirements with both our school year and fiscal
year.

Intro. 1174 creates a task force to review FSF. While we support the spirit of the proposed
legislation that seeks to ensure that the FSF is reviewed by a variety of stakeholders, it is
important to note that FSF is reviewed each year through a community input process that
involves every CEC and the PEP. Each winter, we present, take questions, and receive feedback
from every CEC on the FSF weights for the upcoming year. Following their feedback, we
propose final weights to the PEP, which votes following a 45-day public comment period. We
want to work with the Council to ensure that the proposed legislation aligns with existing
processes for input on FSF.

We know that the most important investment a City can make is in its young people. We believe
that our investments will help ensure that students in every borough, district, neighborhood, and
school have the tools they need to achieve their dreams. With record-high graduation, college
enrollment, and college readiness rates, we are seeing evidence of success to build upon. We
look forward to working with the Council to ensure that FSF continues to be equity-focused, and
that the State fulfills its fiscal obligation and provides funding so all of our schools can be funded
at 100 percent FSF.

Thank you again for your time and the opportunity to testify. Laura and I will be happy to
answer any questions you may have.
































