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Uniform Land Use Review Procedure application no. C 
060294 ZMQ pursuant to §197-c and §197-d of the New York 
City Charter, concerning an amendment to the zoning map, 
Sections 9b, 9d and 13c, Borough of Queens, Council District 
no. 26.

LU 0188-2006

Preconsidered

Uniform Land Use Review Procedure application no. C 
060337 ZMQ pursuant to §197-c and §197-d of the New York 
City Charter, concerning changes to the zoning map, Borough 
of Queens, Council District no. 24.

LU 0106-2006

Zoning resolution amendment application no. N 060338(A) 
ZRY, pursuant to §§197-d and 200 of the New York City 
Charter, respecting changes in the text of the Zoning 
Resolution, to create a new Zoning District, R5D.

LU 0165-2006

Uniform land use review procedure application no. C 060277 
ZSM, pursuant to §197-c and §197-d of the Charter of the City 
of New York concerning a special permit under Section 
74-902 of the Zoning Resolution in the Borough of Manhattan, 
Council District no. 1 to facilitate the construction of a 
supportive housing facility.  This application is subject to 
review and action by the Land Use Committee only if appealed 
to the Council pursuant to §197-d (b)(2) of the Charter or 
called up by vote of the Council pursuant to §197-d (b)(3) of 
the Charter.

LU 0178-2006
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Application no. 20065421 TCQ, pursuant to §20-226 of the 
Administrative Code of the City of New York, concerning the 
petition of Stremones Corp., d/b/a Gyro World, to establish, 
maintain and operate an unenclosed sidewalk café located at 
194-23 Northern Boulevard, Borough of Queens, Council 
District no. 19.  This application is subject to review and action 
by the Land Use Committee only if called-up by vote of the 
Council pursuant to Rule 11.20b of the Council and 
§20-226(g) of the New York City Administrative Code.

LU 0179-2006

AND SUCH OTHER BUSINESS AS MAY BE NECESSARY
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